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Advertising Litigation
Matthew Hartzler

“Fresh, Local, 
Quality” — How 
Unverifiable 
Opinions Evade 
False Advertising 
Claims

For a consumer, the words “Fresh. 
Local. Quality.” attached to a prod-
uct might draw connotations of 
craft beer, artisan goods or farm-to-
table restaurants. But could a com-
petitor sue under the Lanham Act 
if  those “local” goods are actually 
shipped over from a neighboring 
state? When the Tenth Circuit Court 
of Appeals recently evaluated these 
words used to promote a bakery’s 
bread, it deemed the tagline not 
actionable as false advertising and 
merely opinion. A lack of “verifi-
able factual meaning” prevented the 
words from being deemed true or 
false — no matter what the tagline 
might evoke.1

Along with bringing trade secret 
theft and trade dress infringement 
claims, Bimbo Bakeries USA, 
Inc. (Bimbo Bakeries) alleged that 
United States Bakery (US Bakery) 
engaged in false advertising when 
it used the tagline “Fresh. Local. 
Quality.” to advertise US Bakery’s 
bread in stores and on its delivery 
trucks. Following a trial in which 
Bimbo Bakeries provided survey evi-
dence on what consumers believed 
“local” meant, a jury deemed US 
Bakery’s tagline false advertising 
and awarded Bimbo Bakeries over 
$8 million in damages. On review, 
the Tenth Circuit was unimpressed 
with the outcome.

Bimbo Bakeries focused its argu-
ment on the fact that US Bakeries 

claimed its bread was “local.” 
However, US Bakeries baked 
some of  its bread outside of  the 
states in which they were sold. 
This was true for the loaves sold 
in California as well as in Utah 
following a bakery closure in that 
state. Through consumer survey 
evidence, Bimbo Bakeries defined 
“local” as “baked in-state” and 
argued that all out-of-state bread 
was therefore falsely advertised as 
“local.”

The appellate panel assessed that 
“Bimbo Bakeries’ survey, which 
asked consumers about the meaning 
of ‘local,’ cannot somehow convert 
the word into a statement of fact” 
and that “the word ‘local’ cannot be 
adjudged true or false . . . .”2

Only statements of fact are action-
able under the Lanham Act.3 A 
plaintiff  alleging false advertising 
must prove that the promotional 
statement is either false or mislead-
ing. And only factual statements are 
inherently able to be proven true or 
false.

“Local” proved especially chal-
lenging for the Court due to defini-
tions failing to provide how large 
that area or place can be. The 
dictionary definitions offered by 
Bimbo Bakeries — “relating to or 
occurring in a particular area, city, 
or town” and “pertaining to or 
characterized by place or position 
in space; spatial” — had no clear 
outer boundary.4 “In the absence of 
mile markers, literal or figurative, 
we are unable to assess a locality 
claim as a factual matter. We are 
left with the conclusion that ‘local’ 
is simply a statement of  opinion 
with which others may agree or 
disagree without generating legal 
liability.”5

Opinion — 
Something Other 
Than Puffery?

The Court deemed “quality” as 
“quintessential puffery outside the 
Lanham Act,” but the panel did not 
describe “local” as puffery.6 Puffery, 
which has long been deemed non-
actionable under the Lanham Act, 
“is an exaggeration or overstate-
ment expressed in broad, vague, 
and commendatory language.”7 
Claims deemed puffery are gener-
ally ones of product superiority 
such as “America’s Favorite Pasta,” 
and it is not clear that “local” neces-
sarily fits that category of bragging 
or boasting.8

In the Southern District of 
California, a district court assessed 
a similar situation: Whether a 
brewer describing its beer as “art-
fully crafted” was actionable under 
California’s unfair competition 
laws.9 That court concluded that the 
statement lacked a specific meaning 
and merely stated the brewer’s sub-
jective opinion on its beer, allowing 
the brewer to escape liability.

There is no hard line between 
opinion and puffery though. A 
recent Ninth Circuit Court of 
Appeals decision deemed a five-star 
rating system in a guidebook to be 
unquantifiable assertions that are 
“classic, non-actionable opinions or 
puffery.”10

Context Can 
Create Factual 
Statements from 
Opinion

The analysis cannot stop there. 
What appears to be puffery or 
opinion can be transformed into 
verifiable fact depending on the 
context. In a legal battle between 
pizza chains, the tagline “Better 
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Ingredients–Better Pizza” appears 
on its face to be innocuous puff-
ery. However, when the line was 
used as part of  a larger, compara-
tive ad campaign against its rival, 
the Fifth Circuit Court of  Appeals 
held that opinion had transformed 
into a statement of  fact in the 
mind of  a reasonable consumer: 
The “better pizza” came from spe-
cific, “better ingredients.” Because 
the advertising explained that the 
pizza comes from identified fresh 
ingredients, fresh dough, and fil-
tered water, the Court of  Appeals 
felt that context had defined “bet-
ter.” As a result, the tagline took 
on the “characteristics of  a state-
ment of  fact.”11

In Bimbo Bakeries, the Court 
found that even when considering 
all the context, the entire tagline 
“is simply US Bakery’s opinion 
about its product.”12 The gener-
ality and subjectivity of  “fresh” 
and “quality” water down what-
ever specific meaning a consumer 
might place on “local.” The rest 

of  the visual advertising context 
did not imply or provide mean-
ing to the term given that there 
were no comparative statements 
to other brands and no reference 
to a state or city. When the brand’s 
Salt Lake City bakery was active, 
it paired the tagline with the slo-
gan “Freshly baked in Utah,” but 
it ceased using that when that bak-
ing facility closed.

Consumer 
Misunderstanding 
Cannot Generate 
False Advertising 
Claim Alone

The appellate panel conceded that 
some segment of consumers might 
have been misled into believing that 
US Bakeries baked its bread in state: 
“But not every subjective interpre-
tation of ambiguous language is 
actionable false advertising.”13

Quoting the Eighth Circuit’s opin-
ion on “America’s Favorite Pasta,” 
the panel noted that “the Lanham 
Act protects against misleading and 
false statements of fact, not misun-
derstood statements.”14 It summar-
ily concluded, “When the language 
in question is incapable of objective 
verification as to truth or falsity, it 
is not a statement of fact, and no 
amount of misunderstanding will 
give rise to an action under the 
Lanham Act.”
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